
Trial 1 Result:5-1-3 Time: 29.83 Distance: 3.5, 8

Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold
1 1 Missy No Name 4.5 Evaw Finwl 1300 Y
2 3 Ballygloss James 4.57 Slaw Rnon 500 200 N
3 5 Scotchrath 4.38 Qaw Ald 2100 Y

Trial 2 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.71 Distance:7, 7.5

Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold
4 2 Monroe Hanna 4.57 Slaw Bmp 2 350 Y
5 4 Fortunate Blue 4.48 Ald Drclr  3100 Y
6 6 Ushers Moll 4.53 Evaw Bmp 2 150 Y

Trial  3 Result: 5-1-3 Time: 29.96 Distance: 2,10

Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold
8 1 Train Time 4.51 Bmp 1 Finwl . 1050 Y
9 3 Scotchrath Bell 4.55 Slaw Blk 1 250 Y

10 5 Oneco Act 4.47 Faw Ald 1200 Y

Trial 4   Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.72 Distance: 5.5,3

Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold
11 2 Ballinabola Golf 4.38 Faw Evch 600 Y
12 4 Sherkin Tiara 4.46 Evaw Finwl 1800 Y
14 6 So Its Paradise 4.43 Evaw Crd 1 450 Y

Trial  5            Result: 5-1-3 Time: 30.48 Distance: 3.5,2 

Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold
16 1 Looney Tunes 4.46 faw Evch 350 Y
17 3 Out and Around 4.8 Vslaw Styo 1000 300 N
19 5 Sherkin Coronet 4.57 Slaw Finwl 350 Y

Trial  6 Result: 6-4-2 Time:30.00 Distance: 3.5, DIST

Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold
20 2 Noirins Pride 4.72 Slaw Nvsh  0 N
21 4 Make One Up 4.46 Faw Evch 600 300 N
22 6 Ballinabola Net 4.53 Evaw Finwl 0 1600 Y

Trial  7 Result:5-3-1 Time: 29.88 Distance: 5.5, 1

Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold
23 1 Rathmoyle Amelia 4.52 slaw Styo 250 Y
24 3 Triple A Pine 4.5 Evaw Rnon 500 200 N
25 5 Luminous Leaf 4.4 Faw Ald 2000 1200 N

Trial  8 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.51 Distance: 13,4

Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold
26 2 Ushers Jake 4.57 Slaw Bmp 2 0 N
27 4 Jumbos Brother 4.5 Ald Drclr 4000 3400 N
28 6 Rathmoyle Susy 4.5 Evaw Bmp 2 1000 200 N

Trial 9 Result: 5-1-3 Time: 30.95 Distance: 1, 3



Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold
30 1 Ushers Phil 4.6 Slaw Rnon 300 150 N
31 3 Aughabeg Ming 4.48 Ld Bmp 3 250 Y
32 5 Rathmoyle Lailia 4.53 Slaw Rnon 150 Y

Trial 10 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.75 Distance: 5.5, 6.5

Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold
35 2 Tankers Lough 4.55 Slaw Rnon 0 800 Y
36 4 Rathmoyle Sally 4.52 Evaw Rnon 0 200 Y
34 6 Godmother 4.51 Evaw Finwl 900 Y

Trial 11 Result: 5-1-3 Time: 30.63 Distance: nk, 3.5

Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold
37 1 Home Maggie 4.62 Dspld evch 550 Y
38 3 Gowran Hill 4.63 Slaw Rnon 700 200 N
39 5 Me Rock On 4.73 Slaw Finwl  W/D N

Trial 12 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.92 Distance: 1.5, 0.5

Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold
41 2 Home Blessing 4.41 faw Ald  650 Y
42 6 Village King 4.46 Chlbs Bmp 3 700 200 N
43 4 Quivers Bubbles 4.49 Chlbs Bmp 3 450 Y

Trial  13 Result: 5-1-3 Time: 29.53 Distance: 7.5, 10

Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold
44 1 Daroma Sunshine 4.43 Faw Rnon 1200 500 N
45 5 Home Hunter 4.42 Faw Drclr 3000 Y
46 3 Emmas Leader 4.53 Slaw Rnon 400 200 N

Trial   14 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.96 Distance: 14, 1

Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold
47 2 Good Election 4.41 faw fdri 700 350 N
48 4 Kilbreedy Millie 4.52 Slaw Bmp  W/D N
49 6 Daroma Jean 4.48 Evaw Finwl 3000 1000 N

Trial  15 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 29.90 Distance: 6.5, 1

Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold
50 1 Name The Tune 4.49 Blkru Rnon 600 Y
51 3 Swan Diver 4.63 Blkru Finwl 2000 Y
52 5 Product Blue 4.56 Evaw Evch 400 Y

Trial   16 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.91 Distance: 1, 7

Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold
53 2 Good Pogba 4.46 Faw Bmp 2 500 Y
55 4 Dance Cian 4.46 Faw Fdri 0 600 Y
54 6 Quivers Crystal 4.53 Bmp 2 Finwl 900 Y

Trial  17 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.60 Distance: 9.5, 12

Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold
56 6 Ar Luas Lasrach 4.38 Faw Finwl 6000 1800 Y



57 2 Lacken Gemma 4.41 Faw Evch 600 Y
58 4 Mays Chris 4.51 Slaw Nvsh W/D 

Trial 18 Result: 1-5-3 Time: 29.56 Distance: 5.5, 4

Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold
60 5 Dance Mojito 4.41 Faw Evch 900 Y
61 1 Maze Runner 4.43 Crd 2 Finwl 2500 1000 N
62 3 Sadbhs Star 4.37 Faw Evch 500 Y

Trial 19 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.70 Distance: 10, 2.5

Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold
64 2 Whiteys Dustin 4.53 Evaw Bmp 1 150 Y
65 4 Bangor Andy 4.48 Bmp 1 Finwl 1650 Y
69 6 Whiteys Spice 4.53 Evaw Bmp 1 No Bid N

Trial 20 Result: 1-5-3 Time: 29.34 Distance: 0.5, DIST

Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold
70 1 Bangor Ella 4.52 Evaw Finwl 2700 Y
71 3 Gerrys Guinness 4.54 Evaw Nvsh No Bid N
72 5 Nowurhurlin 4.46 Faw Hdnrl 3000 1600 N

Trial 21 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.76 Distance: 5, 10

Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold
74 2 Before God 4.53 Slaw Blk 1 150 Y
75 6 Blackhill Pride 4.42 Faw Finwl W/D N
76 4 Nans Primsoe 4.52 Evaw Rnon W/D N

Trial 22 Result: 1-3-5 Time: 29.18 Distance: 2.5, 17

Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold
77 1 Lemon Franko 4.39 faw Ald 5000 Y
78 5 Ballyfidora Dawn 4.48 Evaw Nvsh No Bid N
81 3 Ballygur Rumble 4.41 Faw Finwl 1000 600 N

Trial 23 Result: 4-2 Time: 30.24 Distance: NK 

Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold
53 2 Fennis Conor 4.43 Faw Evch 500 Y
79 4 Watergate Meabh 4.57 Slaw Rnon No Bid N

Trial 24 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 17.03 Distance: 1, 4

Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold
15 2 Milford Sycology Evaw Rnon 500 Y
59 4 Triangle Pilot Faw Evch 250 Y
63 6 Live Debate Faw Finwl 850 Y


