Trial 1

Lot Trap

1 1

2 3

3 5

Trial 2 Result:
Lot Trap

4 2

5 4

6 6

Trial 3 Result:
Lot Trap

7 1

9 3

10 5

Trial 4 Result:
Lot Trap
11 2

12 4

14 6

Trial 5 Result:
Lot Trap
16 1

17 3

18 5

Trial 6 Result:
Lot Trap
21 2

22 4

23 6

Trial 7 Result:
Lot Trap
25 1

27 3

29 5

Trial 8 Result:
Lot Trap
30 2

31 4

32 6

Trial 9 Result:

4-2-6

1-3-5

6-4-2

5-1-3

2-6-4

3-1-5

2-6-4

1-5-3

Result:3-5-1 Time: 29.62

Name
About It Is
Seany Baby
Woe Boy

Time: 29.67

Name

Neamstown Badger
Bad Rabbit

Monroe Supreme

Time: 30.01

Name
Fantasticelastic
Garryglass Bond
Arklow Air Force

Time: 29.64

Name

Monroe Rosy
Twelvehourshift
Droopys Muddy

Time: 29.70

Name
Narabane Lane
Caulry Pat
Bellmore Lodge

Time: 30.06

Name
Narabane Bolt
Garrycastle Gift
Arrigle Orlaith

Time: 29.95

Name

Bellmore Brandy
Triangle Serena
Peggys Edel

Time: 29.98

Name

Emmas Charm
Local Twist
Kilmacar Hurah

Time: 30.13

Distance:

Split
4.41

4.37
4.49

Distance:

Split
4.62
4.37
4.55

Distance:

Split
4.46
4.52
4.49

Distance:

Split
4.53
4.48
4.39

Distance:

Split
4.44
4.53
4.32

Distance:

Split
4.46
4.6
4.5

Distance:

Split
4.38
4.4

4.46

Distance:

Split
4.42
4.58
4.56

Distance:

12, 2.5

Remarks
Bmpru Blk 2
Bmpru Finwl
Riru Blk 2

6.5, 3

Remarks
Slaw Styo
Faw Ald
Evaw Rnon

2,25

Remarks
Ald CIr
Sbtps Rnon
Evaw Styo

6.5, 2

Remarks
Evaw Rnon
Evaw Rnon
Faw Ald

8.5,3

Remarks
Evaw Rnon
Slaw Stkrls
Qaw Ald

NK, 12

Remarks
Ald CIr

Ck 1 Rnon
Slaw Finwl

1.5,10.5

Remarks
Faw Evch
Bmp 1 Finwl
Evaw Evch

3,3

Remarks
Faw Ald
Slaw Rnon
Evaw Rnon

0.75, 3.5

Reserve

Reserve

Reserve

Reserve

Reserve

Reserve
0

0

800

Reserve

1000

Reserve

0

Bid
250
2800
350

Bid
900
2200
200

Bid
650
1000
550

Bid
550
800
4100

Bid
150
500
1100

Bid
600
No Bid
500

Bid
450
450
No Bid

Bid
1000
650
400

Sold

Sold
Y
Y
Y



Lot Trap
33 1

34 3

36 5

Trial 10 Result:
Lot Trap
38 2

39 4

40 6

Trial 11 Result:
Lot Trap
41 1

42 3

44 5

Trial 12 Result:
Lot Trap
46 2

47 4

49 6

Trial 13 Result:
Lot Trap
51 1

52 3

53 5

Trial 1<Result:
Lot Trap
54 2

56 4

57 6

Trial 15 Result:
Lot Trap
58 2

59 4

Trial 1¢Result:
Lot Trap
61 2

62 4

Trial 17 Result:

Lot Trap
37 3

6-4-2

5-3-1

2-6-4

5-1-3

6-2-4

Solo

Name
Mind Her

Ballina Champion

Leighlin Ted
Time: 29.87
Name

Liberty Boy
Pennys Mullan
Pookies King
Time: 29.73

Name

Bricken Brae
Luminous Hero
Pennys Dumbo

Time: 29.99

Name

Airmount Panther

Advance Gerry
Darach Rioga

Time: 29.56

Name

Airmount Diver
Dance Caoimhe
Billis lllusion

Time: 30.02
Name

Pinnacle Ranger
White Toast
Genuine Mojo
Time: 30.00
Name

Pennys Marengo
Jacks Ranger

Time: 29.96
Name

Tycoon Archie
Kuda Jackdaw
Time: 16.64

Name
Lacken Charlie

Split
4.5

4.59
4.46

Distance:

Split
4.57
4.59
4.47

Distance:

Split
4.56
4.52
4.47

Distance:

Split
4.45
443
4.5

Distance:

Split
4.44
4.4

4.42

Distance:

Split
443
4.45
4.49

Distance:

Split
4.48
4.51

Distance:

Split
4.4
4.42

Distance:

Split

Remarks Reserve
Bmpru Rnon
Blkru Rnon
Bmpru Finwl
SHD, 10
Remarks Reserve
Slaw Crd 1 0
Crd 1 Finwl 1500
Faw Ald
6, HD
Remarks Reserve
Bmpru Styo
Bmpru Rnon
Faw Ald 2500
0.75, 3
Remarks Reserve
Crdrup Bmp 2 2000
Bmp 1 Rnon
Evaw Chlbs
2.5,14.5
Remarks Reserve
Fcdck 1 Finwl 3000
Faw Crd 1
faw Finwl
9.5, HD
Remarks Reserve
Faw CK 3
Faw Ck 3
Evaw Finwl
6.5
Remarks Reserve
Faw Rnon
Evaw Finwl
SHD
Remarks Reserve
Faw Rnon
Faw Chlri 0
Remarks Reserve

Bid
500
700
450

Bid
700
900
1150

Bid
950
550
1100

Bid
1100
500
500

Bid
1700
No Bid
1200

Bid
150
No Bid
650

Bid
W/D
200

Bid
350
No Bid

Bid
850

Sold

Sold

Sold
Y



