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5-3-1

4-2-6

1-5-3

2-6-4

5-1-3

4-2-6

5-1-3

4-2-6

Time: 30.36

Name
1 Cloudy Morning
3 Foulkscourt Lane
5 Ballybough Icon

Time: 29.83

Name
2 Eighteightseven
4 Hello Julie
6 Foulkscourt Boss

Time: 30.16

Name
1 Some Force
3 Bogger Linden
5 Fionns Dream

Time: 29.88

Name
2 Bull Run Busy

4 Knockdrinna Winx

6 Not for Parting
Time: 29.84

Name
1 Drummer Dexter
3 Dream Some
5 Pay The Act

Time: 29.99
Name
2 Roisins Olive
4 Bull Run Buff
6 Hopeful Act
Time: 29.82
Name
1 High St Lola
3 Its an Act
5 Whitefort Ben
Time: 29.76

Name

Distance:

Split

Distance:

Split

Distance:

Split

Distance:

Split

Distance

Split

Distance

Split

Distance

Split

Distance

Split

2,11

Remarks
4.64 Slaw Rnon
4.56 Ldbs Hdnrl

4.66 Msdbk Finwl

4,10

Remarks

4.5 Evaw Rnon

4.47 Faw Ald
4.6 Slaw Rnon

1,15
Remarks
4.59 Slaw Finwl
4.48 Evaw Nvsh
4.46 faw hdnrl
2.5,2

Remarks
4.57 Slaw Finwl

4.5 Evaw Finwl

4.45 Faw Hdnrl
:12,5.5
Remarks

4.45 Faw Evch
4,58 Slaw Stb 1

4.56 Msdbk Finwl

12,125

Remarks
4.41 Faw Evch
4.61 Blk 1 Finwl
4.55 Evaw Blk 1

:10, 0.5

Remarks
4.45 Faw Evch

4.69 Stbtps Rnon

4.55 Ck 1 Finwl

:8.5,10

Remarks

Reserve Bid

Reserve Bid

2000

Reserve

Reserve

Reserve

Reserve

Reserve Bid

Reserve Bid

Sold
NoBid N
650 Y
800 Y

Sold
700 Y
450 n
450 Y

Sold
700 Y
No Bid n
450 Y

Bid

Bid Sold
1600 Y
700 Y

850y

Sold
450 Y
No bid n
2800 y

Bid

Bid Sold
800 y
2000 y

0 250Y

Sold

0 700 y
700 y

0 3600 y

Sold



31

33

34
Trial 9 Result:1-3-5
Lot Trap

35

36

37
Trial 10 Result: 4-6-2
Lot Trap

38

39

40
Trial 11 Result: 3-5-1
Lot Trap

42

44

46
Trial 12 Result: 6-2-4
Lot Trap

45

48

49
Trial 13 Result: 5-1-3
Lot Trap

50

53

52
Trial 14 result: 4-6-2
Lot Trap

54

55

56
Trial 15: Result: 5-1-3
Lot Trap

57

59

61

2 Retweet Katie
4 Luminous Choice
6 Woolys Big Girl

Time: 29.67

Name
1 Whitefort Bert
5 woe Rose
3 Ascot Murry

Time: 29.60

Name
2 Treanaree Lily
4 Goget Champers
6 Westpoint Jet

Time: 29.71

Name
1 Barracuda Blue
3 Gone Galavanting
5 Daryannor Blitz

Time: 30.03

Name
2 Wicked Tuna
4 Ballinabola Jude
6 Harrys Bullet

Time: 30.03

Name
1 Dance Isco
3 Mikeys Choice
5 Rastafari Marley

Time: 29.69

Name
2 Fire Sand
4 Thurlesbeg Angel
6 Kilara Heather

Time: 29.75

Name
1 Fodder Beet
3 Daroma Star
5 Ballinabola Rum

Distance:

Split

Distance:

Split

Distance:

Split

Distance:

Split

Distance

Split

Distance:

Split

Distance

Split

4.52 Evaw Rnon 700 y
4.37 Faw ald 2700 Y
4.61 Slaw Rnon No bid n
4,4
Remarks Reserve Bid Sold
4.53 Evaw Finwl 0 5200 y
4.49 Bmp 1 rnon 700 y
4.46 Faw Ldbs 0 2000 Y
16,7
Remarks Reserve Bid Sold
4.61 Slaw crdrup 0 150 y
4.53 Bmpru Finwl 0 2000 Y
4.66 Blkru Rnon 300 y
4,55
Remarks Reserve Bid Sold
4.49 Evaw Rnon 1000 Y
4.34 Faw ald 2000 Y
4.52 Evaw Rnon 1500 y
75,8
Remarks Reserve Bid Sold
458 0 500 y
4.76 Msdbk Rnon nobid n
4.44 Faw ald 2000 1200 n
: 2, Dist
Remarks Reserve Bid Sold
4.8 Bmpru finwl 500 vy
4.99 Bmpru nvsh w/d n
4.5 Ald Clr 550y
15,1
Remarks Reserve Bid Sold
4.47 Fcdckl Crd 3/4 2000 y
4.41 faw finwl 2100 y
4.41 Faw Crd 3/4 1800 y
:hd, 12
Remarks Reserve Bid Sold
4.5 Crdrup finwl 3000 1600 n
4.45 bmp 1 rnon w/d n
4.38 Faw ald 2000 1700 n



Trial 16:

Lot

Trial 17:

Lot

Trial 18

Lot

Trial 19

Lot

62
63
66

67
68
69

70
71
47

51
60

Result: 4-6-2

Trap

Result: 3-5-1

Trap

Result: 2-4-6

Trap

Result: 4-2

Trap

Time: 29.46

Name
2 Monagore Jet
6 Starshinetrooper
4 Sliabh Bui Duke

Time: 29.89

Name
1 Clonard Champ
3 Trevs Reject
5 Rathbawn Paddy

Time: 29.91

Name
2 Jiggybomber
6 Qatar Legend
4 Milford Master

Time: 17.19
Name

2 Bogger Hip Hop
4 Lizs Mania

Distance: 4, 12

Split

Remarks
4.62 Slaw Rnon
4.5 Faw rnon
4.49 Faw ald

Distance: 22, 14

Split

Remarks
4.59 Blkru Blk 1
4.54 ald Drclr
4.63 BlkruBlk 1

Distance: 6, 10

Split Remarks
4.51 Evaw finwl
4.61 slaw Stb 1
4.49 Evaw Rnon
Distance: 3.5
Split Remarks
Evaw Evch
Evaw finwl

Reserve Bid Sold
w/d
1000 y

3000 2000 n

Reserve Bid Sold
w/d n
1200 y
350 y

Sold
700 y
nobid n
300 y

Reserve Bid

Reserve Bid Sold
no bid

150 y



