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Time: 30.17

Name

Bellmore Bandit
Brosna Jet
Some Lockdown

Time: 29.79

Name
Baunaniska Cindy
Brosna Pet
Darbys Gold

Time: 30.06

Name

Ranchers Blake
Darbys Dreamer
Dolce Dreamer

Time: 29.61

Name

Darbys Spirit
Ranchers Lassie
Kilgraney Misty

Time: 29.71

Name

Biscuit Lady
Moonlight Dance
Skirk Shadow

Time: 29.44
Name
Ranchers Ruby

Peewee
Kilgraney Silver

Time: 29.68
Name

Daring Jenny
Unreliable
Chubbys Karma

Time: 30.68
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4.41
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4.57
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Reserve

2000

Reserve

Msdbk Crd 1/2
Crd 1/2 Finwl 1500

Crd 1 Rnon
8,7.5

Remarks
Slaw Rnon
Faw ald
Slaw Rnon

:7.5,6.5

Remarks
Impru Rnon
Evaw Finwl
Evaw Rnon

4,5.5

Remarks
Impru Finwl
Rlru Rnon
Slaw Rnon

85,1
Remarks
Faw Bmpbs
Evaw Finwl
Slaw Rnon

: nk, 0.5

Remarks

Reserve
1500

Reserve

500

Reserve

Reserve

Reserve

Bid
1100
no bid
700

Bid
2100
150
1100

Bid
1300
950
350

Bid
950
1700
no bid

Bid
200
1500
950

Bid
2900
1750
350

Bid
350
1950
150
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5-3-1

6-4-2

1-3-5

2-6-4

Brosna Pickles 4.49
Ketch Up Lolli 4.5
Puckane Image  4.58
Time: 31.68 Distance
Name Split
Chubys Sonic 4.58
Cashmere Cooper 4.47
Brosna Maggie  4.57
Time: 29.98 Distance:
Name Split
Dance Pondo 4.47
Effernogue Brady 4.51
Lemon Barry 4.45
Time: 30.14 Distance
Name Split
Dance Tammy 4.39
Effernogue Beef 4.43
Listen Mikey 4.55
Time: 30.12 Distance
Name Split
Lemon Mossy 4.5
Listen Kiva 4.57
Airmount Bally  4.47
Time: 29.50 Distance:
Name Split
Oakvale Choice  4.71
Ballyhoe Jingle 4.42
Kildare King 4.47
Time: 30.28 Distance:
Name Split
Airmount Lark 4.45
Knockdrinna JoJo 4.45
Kilcash Jo 4.5
Time: 30.02 Distance:
Name Split
Luminous Candle 4.45
Danger Mouse  4.52
Airmount Angie  4.46
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Reserve
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no bid
no bid

Bid
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550
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Bid
1050
600
250
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550
550
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400

n
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Trial 16 Result: 3-5-1

Lot Trap
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Time: 30.14

Name

Wills Panther
Daring Expert
Mild Enough

Time: 30.41

Name

Wills Apollo
Carlsbush Best
Under The Stars

Time: 30.43

Name

Mild View
Rattlednet
Outlier Boss

Time: 29.85

Name
Mild Air
Droopys Helmet

Time: 30.53
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Clodeen Sabbath
Arrigle Bally
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4.6
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4.52
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Remarks Reserve
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Faw Ald 2000
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Bid
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550
no bid
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