

**Trial 1    Result: 5-1-3    Time: 29.63    Distances: 1.5L, 4.5L**

<b>Lot</b>	<b>Trap</b>	<b>Name</b>	<b>Split</b>	<b>Remarks</b>	<b>Reserve</b>	<b>Bid</b>	<b>Sold</b>
1	1	Pyro Man	4.39	FAw HdNrL		1500	Y
2	3	Mustang Coco	4.46	ClrRn RnOn		850	Y
3	5	Rebel Ivy	4.37	FAw FinWI		2650	Y

**Trial 2    Result: 6-4-2    Time: 30.08    Distances: 3.5L, 1L**

<b>Lot</b>	<b>Trap</b>	<b>Name</b>	<b>Split</b>	<b>Remarks</b>	<b>Reserve</b>	<b>Bid</b>	<b>Sold</b>
4	2	Mustang Sandra	4.43	Blk 1 RnOn		900	Y
5	4	Doctor No	4.45	CrDRu Bmp 2	2500	1100	N
6	6	Knockdrinna Lady	4.4	Blk 1 FinWI		900	Y

**Trial 3    Result: 3-5-1    Time: 29.93    Distances: 2.5, 10L**

<b>Lot</b>	<b>Trap</b>	<b>Name</b>	<b>Split</b>	<b>Remarks</b>	<b>Reserve</b>	<b>Bid</b>	<b>Sold</b>
7	1	Mustang Dazl	4.68	SlAw RnOn		750	Y
8	5	Plenty O Toole	4.58	ClrRn FinWI		500	Y
9	3	Bandit Mountain	4.45	ALd ClrRn		1300	Y

**Trial 4    Result: 4-6-2    Time: 29.74    Distances: 2.5L, 10L**

<b>Lot</b>	<b>Trap</b>	<b>Name</b>	<b>Split</b>	<b>Remarks</b>	<b>Reserve</b>	<b>Bid</b>	<b>Sold</b>
10	2	Jays Falcon	4.39	Bmp 1 RnOn		1000	Y
11	4	Glideaway Falcon	4.28	QAww Bmp 1		2000	Y
12	6	Wishful Decko	4.37	ClrRn FinWI		700	Y

**Trial 5    Result: 5-3-1    Time: 29.67    Distances: 8L, .5L**

<b>Lot</b>	<b>Trap</b>	<b>Name</b>	<b>Split</b>	<b>Remarks</b>	<b>Reserve</b>	<b>Bid</b>	<b>Sold</b>
13	1	Jays Scout	4.41	ClrRn RnOn		450	Y
14	3	Tea Please	4.41	ClrRn RnOn		900	Y
15	5	Glideaway Onana	4.28	QAww ALd		2300	Y

**Trial 6    Result: 4-6-2    Time: 29.74    Distances: 2.5L, 5L**

<b>Lot</b>	<b>Trap</b>	<b>Name</b>	<b>Split</b>	<b>Remarks</b>	<b>Reserve</b>	<b>Bid</b>	<b>Sold</b>
16	2	Jays Gloss	4.41	SlAw RnOn		200	Y
17	4	Luminous Bucko	4.32	FAw StydWI		2400	Y
18	6	Woe Colette	4.42	ChIBS RnOn		600	Y

**Trial 7    Result: 5-3-1    Time: 29.24    Distances: 6.5L, 10L**

<b>Lot</b>	<b>Trap</b>	<b>Name</b>	<b>Split</b>	<b>Remarks</b>	<b>Reserve</b>	<b>Bid</b>	<b>Sold</b>
19	1	Jays Ruby	4.56	ClrRn RnOn		500	Y
20	5	Keylogues Runner	4.36	FAw FinWI		5000	Y

21 3 Doonanes Lucia 4.4 FAw RnOn 400 Y

**Trial 8 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 30.36 Distances: 1.5L, 3.5L**

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
22	2	Kilara Tonic	4.4	ALd ClrRn	300	Y	Y
23	4	Memories Smile	4.49	Bmp 1 RnOn	200	Y	Y
24	6	Jayne Mack	4.52	Blk 1 FinWI	600	Y	Y

**Trial 9 Result: 1-3-5 Time: 29.92 Distances: 4.5L, 12L**

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
25	1	Faithful Lucy	4.45	ClrRn FinWI	1300	Y	Y
26	3	Rebel Neptune	4.48	Bmp 2 RnOn	1050	Y	Y
27	5	Assurula Falls	4.36	Bmp 1 Blk 2	650	Y	Y

**Trial 10 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.45 Distances: 7.5L, Hd**

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
28	2	Liberty Doll	4.42	FcdCk 1 RnOn	700	Y	Y
29	6	Memories Dream	4.34	FAw FinWI	1800	Y	Y
30	4	Champagne Zombi	4.39	Crd 1 RnOn	550	Y	Y

**Trial 11 Result: 3-5-1 Time: 30.30 Distances: .75L, 3.5L**

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
31	1	Kilara Gin	4.52	SI Aw RnOn	250	Y	Y
32	3	Private Best	4.48	ALd ClrRn	1100	Y	Y
33	5	A Days Luck	4.57	SI Aw FinWI	400	Y	Y

**Trial 12 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.58 Distances: 8L, 3L**

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
34	2	Faithful Cherry	4.46	ClrRn FinWI	1750	Y	Y
35	6	Memories Town	4.45	ClrRn RnOn	No Bid	N	N
36	4	Step Back Jack	4.34	FAw EvCh	350	Y	Y

**Trial 13 Result: 3-5-1 Time: 29.93 Distances: 5.5L, 13.5L**

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
37	1	Shes Fussing	4.48	SI Aw NvShw	150	Y	Y
38	3	Arrigle Great	4.32	FAw FinWI	650	Y	Y
39	5	Kanturk Ten	4.37	LdBS EvCh	150	Y	Y

**Trial 14 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.95 Distances: 1.5L, 6L**

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
40	6	Knockdrinna Buck	4.39	FAw RnOn	350	Y	Y

41	2	Devilsbit Rose	4.53	ClrRn FinWI	1350	Y
42	4	Jittery Just	4.44	SI Aw RnOn	No Bid	N

**Trial 15 Result: 5-1-3 Time: 29.23 Distances: 25L, 7L**

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
43	1	Buda Tom	4.4	SI Aw NvShw		No Bid	N
44	3	Not Fussing	4.47	SI Aw NvShw		No Bid	N
45	5	Glenadda Meabh	4.42	ClrRn FinWI	5000	2600	N

**Trial 16 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.29 Distances: 29.29**

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
46	2	Millroad Bowie	4.28	QA w ALd		2200	Y
47	4	Enjoy Your Life	4.33	FA w RnOn		No Bid	N
48	6	Ballysloe Duke	4.38	ClrRn FinWI		1150	Y

**Trial 17 Result: 5-1-3 Time: 29.98 Distances: 5.5L, 11.5L**

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
49	1	Maxgrove Diamond	4.38	Bmp 1 Crd 2		750	Y
50	3	Beechill Best	4.28	QA w Bmp 1		No Bid	N
52	5	Steady Teddy	4.48	Bmp 1 FinWI		950	Y

**Trial 18 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.55 Distances: 3.5L, .75L**

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
53	6	Ballysloe Hero	4.4	Ahandy FinWI		1250	Y
54	2	Chubbys Robin	4.37	ClrRn RnOn		650	Y
55	4	Quacks	4.29	QA w EvCh		1250	Y

**Trial 19 Result: 1-5 Time: 30.07 Distances: .75L**

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
56	1	Geneva Eagle	4.38	FinWI LdNrL		500	Y
57	5	Keegal Survivor	4.24	QA w HdNrL		300	Y

**Trial 20 Result: 4-6 Time: 29.71 Distances: 1L**

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
58	6	Foyle Laura	4.41	ClrRn StydOn		900	Y
60	4	Trimmer Ball	4.37	FA w ALd		900	Y

**Trial 21 Result: Solo Time: 16.89**

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
59	2	Triangle Belinda	5.46		500	200	N