
Trial 1 Result        3-5-1                    Time  29.28         Distances 15 - 16 

LOT TRAP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RESERVE BID SOLD
1 1 Corcass Nimble 1.91 Slaw Nvsh No Bid N

3 3 Funding Crisis 1.73 Qaw Ald 7,000.00€  Y

2 5 Southern City 1.75 Faw Outp 1,500.00€  Y

Trial 2 Result     4-2-6                              Time   29.65         Distances 2.5 - 1

LOT TRAP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RESERVE BID SOLD
4 2 Hope Eternal 1.94 Slaw Finwll 1,500.00€  Y

5 4 Smiling Minnie 1.71 Faw Ald No Bid N

6 6 Lilstock Pier 2.11 Slaw Finwll 1,450.00€  Y

Trial 3 Result    5-3-1                               Time 29.95         Distances  1 - 5.5 

LOT TRAP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RESERVE BID SOLD

7 1 Corcass Millie 1.92 Slaw Rnon 450.00€     Y

8 3 Ranchers Bernie 1.85 Evaw Finwll 1,050.00€  Y

9 5 Tracys Snowflake 1.71 Faw Ald 700.00€     Y

Trial 4 Result         6-2-4                          Time  30.29         Distances  3 - 6

LOT TRAP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RESERVE BID SOLD

13 2 Ferryforthbailey 1.82 Evaw Outp 600.00€     Y

10 4 Dance Gigi 1.93 Slaw Blk1 350.00€     Y

11 6 Tehani 1.83 Evaw Finwll 1,050.00€  Y

Trial 5 Result       3-5-1                              Time 29.74         Distances 6.5 - 6.5 

LOT TRAP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RESERVE BID SOLD

14 1 Athlacca Salah 1.81 W1 Nvsh No Bid N

16 3 Tracys Rock 1.68 Qaw Ald 1,350.00€  Y

17 5 Morillo 1.82 Evaw Rnon 800.00€     Y

Trial 6 Result           4-2-6                           Time  29.49         Distances 3.5 - 2

LOT TRAP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RESERVE BID SOLD
18 2 Bull Run Blake 1.92 Slaw Finwll 2,000.00€  Y

19 4 Birchwood 1.78 Ld1 Styd 4,000.00€        1,800.00€  N

20 6 Oakfield Magic 1.96 Slaw Rnon 2,000.00€        1,050.00€  N

Trial 7 Result     3-5-1                        Time 29.54  Distances 6.5 - 6.5 

LOT TRAP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RESERVE BID SOLD
23 1 Bonera Jo Show 1.88 Slaw Outp 800.00€           300.00€     N

22 3 Chasing Tail 1.78 Ld1 Styd 1,400.00€  Y

21 5 Black On Black 1.82 Evaw Rnon 250.00€     Y

Trial 8 Result    6-2-4                              Time 29.43 Distances  3 - 2.5

LOT TRAP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RESERVE BID SOLD
24 2 Bull Run Berry 1.89 Dspld Outp 1,500.00€        600.00€     N

26 4 Chasing Katie 1.86 Evaw Outp 1,450.00€  Y

25 6 Generous Time 1.76 W1 Finwll 600.00€     Y



Trial 9 Result          5-1-3                       Time  30.06 Distances 2.5 - 11

LOT TRAP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RESERVE BID SOLD
27 1 Star Tiger 1.89 Slaw Finwll 800.00€     Y

28 3 Walk Away Johnny 1.92 Slaw Nvsh N

29 5 Murlens Quattro 1.70 Qaw Ald N

Trial 10 Result        6-4-2                           Time 29.70 Distances 11 - 4.5

LOT TRAP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RESERVE BID SOLD
30 2 Bonera Rocket 1.86 Slaw Nvsh 800.00€           300.00€     N

32 4 Knockroe Sky 1.71 Ldbs Outp No Bid N

33 6 Chasing Lauren 1.84 Evaw Finwll 1,600.00€  Y

Trial 11 Result        5-3-1                             Time 29.57 Distances  8 - SH

LOT TRAP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RESERVE BID SOLD

37 1 Knockroe Tom 1.71 Dspld Outp 1,200.00€  Y

36 3 Moneygall Tom 1.82 Slaw Finwll 450.00€     Y

35 5 Murlens Mustang 1.78 Evew Finwll 2,000.00€        1,050.00€  N

Trial 12 Result     4-6-2                         Time 30.45 Distances 2 - 11

LOT TRAP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RESERVE BID SOLD

40 2 Brosna Sancheq 1.76 Faw Blk1 No Bid N

42 4 Johnnys Tonetta 1.76 Blk1 Finwll 1,500.00€        600.00€     N

43 6 Moneygall Emma 1.99 Slaw Finwll No Bid N

Trial 13 Result     1-5-3                              Time 30.11 Distances 1 - 19

LOT TRAP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RESERVE BID SOLD

44 1 Zoos John 1.92 Slaw Finwll 1,000.00€        550.00€     N

46 3 Brosna Shaq 1.87 Evaw Std2 250.00€     Y

49 5 Monroe Quittin 1.81 Faw Evch 650.00€     Y

Trial 14 Result     2-4-6                           Time 29.68 Distances 1.5 - 12.5

LOT TRAP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RESERVE BID SOLD
51 2 Cabra Doobie 1.73 Ld1 Styd N

52 4 Lacken Bolger 1.76 Evaw Styd 750.00€     Y

53 6 Pimley Place 1.78 Slaw Nvsh No Bid N

Trial 15 Result    3-5-1                           Time 30.01 Distances 6 - NK

LOT TRAP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RESERVE BID SOLD
54 1 Cooneen Jessie 1.76 Ldbs Fd N

55 3 Lambeth Road 1.86 Evaw Finwll 950.00€     Y

56 5 Ballinulty Angel 1.93 Slaw Rnon 350.00€     Y

Trial 16 Result   6-2-4                           Time 30.13 Distances 0.5 - 2.5  

LOT TRAP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RESERVE BID SOLD
59 2 Alaskan Jewel 1.66 Ldbs Evch 250.00€     Y

57 4 Curryhills Tiana 1.86 Slaw Rnon N

58 6 Dance Candy 1.83 Slaw Finwll 300.00€     Y

Trial 17 Result  5-1-3                                    Time 29.60 Distances 4 - 8   

LOT TRAP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RESERVE BID SOLD
60 1 Curryhills Grace 1.84 Blk1 Rnon N

61 3 Dance Mason 1.78 Evaw Blk1 300.00€     Y

12 5 Bull Run Battle 1.79 Evaw Finwll 2,500.00€  Y

Trial 18 Result  2-4                                    Time 30.23 Distance 2.5   

LOT TRAP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RESERVE BID SOLD
15 2 Ballyboy Sky 1.89 Slaw Finwll 2,000.00€        750.00€     N

34 4 Smokey Frank 1.70 Ld4 Evch 750.00€     Y



Trial 19 Result  5-3                                    Time 29.76 Distance  2   

LOT TRAP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RESERVE BID SOLD
38 3 Monroe Duckling 1.80 Ldbs Evch 2,400.00€        800.00€     N

45 5 Elms Wild 1.79 Evaw Finwll 950.00€     Y

Trial 20 Result  4-2                                    Time 29.92 Distance 6

LOT TRAP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RESERVE BID SOLD
41 2 Monroe Outlaw 1.97 Slaw Rnon N

50 4 Elms Survivor 1.87 Faw Ald 700.00€     Y


