
Heat 1
LOT TRAP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RESERVE BID SOLD Y/N
1 2 Kanturk No 4.23 Ev, Aw €800 Yes
2 4 Deelish Borna 4.13 EP  DrClr €2,400 sold off bench
3 6 Barnagrane Kerry  4.45 Evaw Rnon €700 Yes
Restults 4,2,6 Distances 5,6 Time 29.54
Heat 2
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
4 1 Ferryforth  Logan 4.24 Evaw Crd1 €450 Yes
7 3 Ballygibba Borna 4.35 Evaw Crd1 No Bid
8 5 Light Flicker 4.27 Evaw Finwll €400 Yes
Restults 5,1,3 Distances 0.50,1 Time 30.46
Heat 3
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
9 2 Burgess Jack 4.26 Qaw Crd 2 €850 Yes
10 4 Imokilly Gypsy 4.43 Evaw Rnon No Bid
11 6 Athlacca Thunder 4.23 €3,000 €1,000 Not Sold 
Restults 6,2,4 Distances 4,7 Time 29.69
Heat 4
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
12 1 Dellser Bono 4.15 Bmp 1 €2,200 Yes
13 3 Ballygibba Ruby  4.1 Bmp 1 €3,000 €1,000 Not Sold 
14 5 Burgess Flight 4.25 Evaw Finwll €300 Yes
Restults 1,5,3 Distances 4,6 Time 29.8
Heat 5
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
15 6 Dawstown Lady (m) 4.27 Evaw Finwll €650 Yes
16 2 Athlacca Best 4.09 Ep Rnon €800 Yes
17 4 Unknown Comet 4.29 Evaw Finwll €3,000 €1,200 No 
Restults 2,4,6 Distances Sh,1 Time 29.72
Heat 6
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
18 1 Oakvalley Boy EP Stydon No No Bid
19 3 Mind Matters EP DRClr €1,600 Yes
20 5 Hollyhill Jade (w) Evaw Rnon €100 Yes
Restults 3,1,5 Distances 10, 0.50 Time 29.3
Heat 7
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
21 6 Knockglass Rover (w) 4.37 Evaw Rnon €100 Yes
22 2 Brickey King 4.41 Evaw Rnon €450 Yes
23 4 Imokilly Bucks 4.48 EvawRnon €150 Not Sold 
Restults 2,6,4 Distances 3.50.5 Time 30.45
Heat 8
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
24 1 Unknown Princess 4.25 Ep Awld €450 Yes
25 3 Cavies Sue 4.23 EP Hd Nrline €500 €150 Not Sold 
26 5 Aghavine Ricky 4.41 Msdbk Crd3 Withdrawn
Restults 1,3,5 Distances 0.50,4 Time 30.04
Heat 9
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
27 6 Hollyhill Murty (m) 4.26 EP Rnon €150 Yes
28 2 Brickey  Duke 4.26 Evaw Rnon €150 Not Sold 
29 4 Wagga Bale (m) 4.17 EP  DrClr €2,000 €950 Not Sold 
Restults 4,6,2 Distances 8.50,12 Time 29.54
Heat 10
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
30 5 Bellybuster (w) 4.16 EP Stydon €500 Yes



31 3 Hollyhill Bucks (m) 4.37 Evaw  Rnon No No Bid
32 1 Burgess Lyon 4.28 Evaw Finwll €3,900 Yes
Restults 1,5,3 Distances 4,9 Time 29.38
Heat 11
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
33 2 Cavies Johnson 4.17 EP  HDNrline €3,000 €1,700 No 
34 6 Gortatlea Dream 4.21 Evaw Ldnrline €2,500 €1,100 No 
35 4 Dromana Ollie 4.36 Evaw Rnon €800 Yes
Restults 6,2,4 Distances 0.50,4.50 Time 29.42
Heat 12
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
36 1 Ballyverry Black 4.3 Evaw Rnon €600 Yes
37 3 Burgess Mission 4.21 Ep Hdnrline €1,500 €1,050 No 
38 5 Serenity  Yogi 4.24 Evaw Ldnrline €900 Yes
Restults 5,3,1 Distances 0.50,3 Time 29.81
Heat 13
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

4 Deerjet Buick (m) 4.25 Evaw Rnon €550 Yes
2 Ferryforth Eddie 4.53 Slaw Finwll €700 Yes
6 Serenity  Rosebud (w) 4.2 EP Ald €700 Yes

Restults Distances Time
Heat 14
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

Restults Distances Time
Heat 15
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

Restults Distances Time
Heat 16 0
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
57

Restults 2 Distances Time
Heat 17
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

Restults Distances 10 Time
Heat 18
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

Restults Distances Time
Heat 19
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

Restults Distances Time



Heat 20
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

Restults Distances 0.5 Time

Heat 21
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N

Restults Distances Time


